
HILLEL BAVLI
1893-1961; family name Raschgolin, Raschgolsky (hence Bavli), father rav is 
Lithuanian town; learned with father and then briefly in Kovno and then to US 
in 1912; studied at Columbia, Hebrew teaching and then at JTS. Shirim, 1938, 
Divir, contains two volumes; the first has poems from 1910-28. Aderet 
hashanim, Mossad Bialik, 1955.

Presented by Epstein as a man who declined extremes, found his identity in his 
calling as a poet, accepted the fate of obtaining beauty from sadness, a classical 
writer by temperament who goes deeper in the existing forms and explores 
what is unchangingly human about humankind.

Early poems written at the time of his immigration express a pained sense of 
dislocation and anomie. Of the American Hebrew poets, an example of turning 
away from the din of the immigrant experience; no attempt to engage it. Never 
entirely alienated from his roots in his father’s home in Lita and from his rela. 
to the tradition. Scattered throughout the collection are a genre rare among the 
Americans: prayers to God, supplications, kinds of selihot. (Some have been 
incorporated in the Conservative liturgy.) P. 51 surprised to find a prayer 
issuing from his lips in this alien land. 64 poem on experience in church and 
the seductiveness of Christian liturgy, with rejection at end.

Al berakhat George, 125-8, with last poem dedicated to Halkin. Abandonment 
to the beauty of nature, uplifted, delighted, sustained in spirit, but not a source 
of transcendence. And here, perhaps, is the diff. from Halkin; nature for Bavli 
is the font of metaphysical exploration but remains on the level of the senses 
and the spirit.

Beginning at the end of Book One, narrative emerges as a key strategy for B. 
Mrs. Woods, 136-45 is a celebrate and anthologized idyll/poema that fuses the 
fascination with rural America with the preoccupation with portraiture, story 
telling, monologue. Edwin Arlington Robinson as key figure [TO BE 
INVESTIGATED!] and ideal. Eulogy poem quoted by Epstein. Idealization of 
old America, dream of wholeness. Parallel effort in Bema’avar leNew York, 
149-55 on believing Jew who has lived in Staten Island for 30 isolated from the 
teeming Jewish immigrant neighborhoods and suffers the absence of Jewish 
life. Monologue on the ferry.

Book Two opens with the cycle Neginot Erets, written on and in the wake of 
his trip to EY in 1928. Identified with labor and settlement and oppressed by 
the religious sites. Compare to the thinness of Efros’s cycle, which is all about 
ships and the ocean. Here the connection to the land is critical and the sense of 
painful resignation at departing is powerful. Disappointment in himself 
(Bevekhi mimekh yatsati, 199); fated sacrifice. But, as in the case of many of 
the writers, we do not know, at least from the poetry, the constraints and factors 
in their choice not to settle.



Poems addressing the poet, himself; Epstein: basic situation is beauty extracted 
from sorrow; classic lyric move.

Love poetry: two extended cycles: Ts’if yegonim (297-332) and Besevakh 
hayamim (43346־). As E remarks, these are not of the drunken abandonment of 
youth but a more mature man who enters and experiences the tangle of 
emotions involved in loving another and parting. Measured, extended; diff. bet. 
the two.

Poem on changed friendship, 341: meditating on time and acquaintance 
Moving tribute to Silkiner, 344

Benai Lita cyle in Aderet hashanim (impresses Harshav): flowing narrative, 
monologue portraits, types from childhood shtetl.




